Colclasure, James
m

From: Krivit, Dan <Dan.Krivit@Foth.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 23, 2014 10:13 AM

To: Gates, Jim

Subject: FYI & file...---> FW: Bloomington - Request for latest County list of recycling prices by
city

lim,

FYI & file. I may have not forwarded this to you in the heat of the moment during our preparations for the March 17
study session. One more to come.

Dan Krivit, Senior Project Manager

Foth Infrastructure & Environment, LLC

Eagle Point Il

8550 Hudson Boulevard North, Suite 105

Lake Elmo, MN 55042

Direct Phone: (651) 288-8509 / Cell Phone: (612) 616-7739
General Phone: (651) 288-8550 / Fax: (651) 288-8552
Dan.Krivit@Foth.com

http://www.Foth.com

Go Green, keep it on the screen. Please do not print this email unless necessary.

From: Paul Kroening [mailto:Paul.Kroening@hennepin.us]

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2014 3:46 PM

To: Krivit, Dan

Cc: Benjamin L Knudson

Subject: RE: Bloomington - Request for latest County list of recycling prices by city

Unfortunately our staff looked at their audit records and got back to me and any pertinent info they have is from 2005
orolder. We hire a CPA firm to do audits as well and they have done the audits of haulers the last couple of years that
would have this info.

From: Krivit, Dan [mailto:Dan.Krivit@Foth.com]

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2014 2:02 PM

To: Paul Kroening

Cc: Benjamin L Knudson

Subject: RE: Bloomington - Request for latest County list of recycling prices by city

Paul, thanks. Bloomington is more focused on residential, not so much on commercial. Do the audits get at residential
customer charges?

Speaking of which, does the audit ever look for price/cost switching from trash prices/costs into recycling to avoid some
more of the County charge and State SWM tax?

Ben, thanks for the spreadsheet file!! VERY helpful. 'm crunching some of these numbers now to summarize a few

bottom line conclusions in terms of price ranges and aggregated averages where it is possible. Once I'm done, | can
share back if you would like.



THANKS again!

Dan Krivit, Senior Project Manager

Foth Infrastructure & Environment, LLC

Eagle Point Il

8550 Hudson Boulevard North, Suite 105

Lake EImo, MN 55042

Direct Phone: (651) 288-8509 / Cell Phone: (612) 616-7739
General Phone: (651) 288-8550 / Fax: (651) 288-8552
Dan.Krivit@Foth.com

http://www.Foth.com

Go Green, keep it on the screen. Please do not print this email unless necessary.

From: Paul Kroening [mailto:Paul.Kroening@hennepin.us]

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2014 1:56 PM

To: Krivit, Dan

Cc: Benjamin L Knudson

Subject: RE: Bloomington - Request for latest County list of recycling prices by city

Our solid waste folks are going to look at findings from audits of solid waste haulers and any pricing they recorded in
their audit findings. Will be tomorrow before they can pull together that info and it may be a little hit and miss. When
they audit, they look at management fees paid by that hauler and then randomly look at some customer bills to make
sure the charges for services meshes with the fees paid.

From: Benjamin L Knudson

Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2014 1:40 PM

To: Krivit, Dan

Cc: Paul Kroening

Subject: RE: Bloomington - Request for latest County list of recycling prices by city

Dan, | attached the spreadsheet with the information I have about recycling, garbage, and organics.

Ben Knudson

Hennepin County Environmental Services
701 Fourth Ave S, Suite 700

Minneapolis, MN 55415

612-596-1176
Benjamin.Knudson@hennepin.us

From: Krivit, Dan [mailto:Dan.Krivit@Foth.com]
Sent: Thursday, March 13, 2014 1:13 PM

To: Benjamin L Knudson
Cc: Paul Kroening
Subject: Bloomington - Request for latest County list of recycling prices by city

Ben,

I just spoke with Paul Kroening and he suggested this email.



Foth continues to draft the City of Bloomington Solid Waste Management Plan. City staff have requested additional data
on the prices for various services in contract vs. open hauling cities for:

¢ Trash

¢ Recycling

¢ Organics

¢ Yard waste

My understanding from Paul is that you are the keeper of the County list of such prices, at least for recycling and
organics. Can you share with me what you have? Paul stated that there is no systematic “trash price” data maintained
by the County, but | would take anything you have.

I understand that Re-TRAC assembles some of this type “recycling contract price” data. But the Re-TRAC output reports
still need further data analysis and quality control before they can be used reliably.

Thanks.

Dan Krivit, Senior Project Manager

Foth Infrastructure & Environment, LLC

Eagle Point Il

8550 Hudson Boulevard North, Suite 105

Lake Elmo, MN 55042

Direct Phone: (651) 288-8509 / Cell Phone: (612) 616-7739
General Phone: (651) 288-8550 / Fax: (651) 288-8552
Dan.Krivit@Foth.com

http://www.Foth.com

Go Green, keep it on the screen. Please do not print this email unless necessary.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

This communication including any attachments, (E-mail) is confidential and may be proprietary, privileged or
otherwise protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender,
permanently delete this E-Mail from your system and destroy any copies. Any use of this E-Mail, including
disclosure, distribution or replication, by someone other than its intended recipient is prohibited.

This E-Mail has the potential to have been altered or corrupted due to transmission or conversion. it may not
be appropriate to rely upon this E-Mail in the same manner as hardcopy materials bearing the author's original
signature or seal.

Disclaimer: Information in this message or an attachment may be government data and thereby subject to the
Minnesota Government Data Practices Act, Minnesota Statutes, Chapter 13, may be subject to attorney-client or
work product pr1v1lege may be confidential, privileged, proprietary, or otherwise protected, and the
unauthorized review, copying, retransmission, or other use or disclosure of the information is strictly prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient of this message, please immediately notify the sender of the transmission
error and then promptly delete this message from your computer system.



